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Decorative timber Stain 

 

TECHNICAL DATA SHEET 

Description:   Special stain for robust objects such as 
garden tables, side tables, garden chairs, benches, sheds, 
etc. made from untreated reclaimed wood or unplaned 
wood. Also suitable for use on other soft untreated 
types of wood. For interior and exterior use. 
 
Application  
Stir thoroughly prior to use. Apply in the direction of the 
grain using a broad long-haired brush.  
 
Drying time at 23°C : Dust dry after approximately 4 hours 
and can be painted over after approximately 24 hours.  
 
Dilute with:  Ready to use. 
 
Covers : Heavily dependent on the coating thickness and 
the structure of the surface to be treated. 
 
SYSTEM CONSTRUCTION 
 
Preparation  
Remove dirt and any moss or algae, clean with paint 
cleaner or ammonia and leave to dry.  
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

TECHNICAL DATA      
 
Dilute with:  Ready to use 
 
Hazard classification: See safety information sheet 
(MSDS) 
 
Tool cleaning instructions:  
It is recommended to use disposable brushes. 
 
Storage: Minimum of 12 months in the tightly sealed 
original packaging in a dry, cool and frost-free place. 
 
General information  
Do not use in temperatures below 10°C, in direct sunlight 
or when rain or fog is expected. Replace the lid firmly after 
use, turn the can upside down and then store in an upright 
position. 
Harmful particles may be released when sanding or 
scraping off coats of paint, etc. Work in a well-ventilated 
area and use the correct protective equipment if 
necessary. 
 
Warning:  Used rags and cloths can ignite if they become 
overheated. Always spread them out and leave outside to 
dry or pour water over them. 
  
Surplus product: This product and the packaging should 
be disposed of at a collection point for hazardous or 
special waste. 
 


